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Product Description
Monoclonal Anti-Myosin (Skeletal, Slow) (mouse IgG1 
isotype) is derived from the NOQ7.5.4D hybridoma 
produced by the fusion of mouse myeloma cells and 
splenocytes from BALB/c mice. Myosin, purified from 
myofibrils isolated from human skeletal muscle, was 
used as the immunogen.1-3 The isotype is determined 
by a double diffusion immunoassay using Mouse 
Monoclonal Antibody Isotyping Reagents, Catalog 
Number ISO2.

Monoclonal Anti-Myosin (Skeletal, Slow) recognizes an 
epitope located on the heavy meromyosin portion of 
human adult skeletal muscle slow myosin.1 In rat, the 
product is highly specific for the slow myosin heavy 
chain of adult skeletal muscle. It does not react with the 
fast myosin heavy chain. It does not cross-react with 
embryonic or neonatal rat skeletal myosins,2 nor with 
cat fetal/embryonic skeletal myosin.4 Using 
immunohistochemical staining, the antibody reacts with 
human adult type I skeletal muscle fibers and with car-
diac muscle cells. It also reacts faintly with adult human 
C-Fibers, co-expressing myosin heavy chain I and IIa in 
variable ratios. The product shows no reactivity with 
human or rat adult smooth muscle or with non-muscle 
tissues.  The product may be used in immunoblotting,1-

3,6 ELISA, 1,3,4 solid-phase RIA, 2 immunohistology 
(frozen,1-5,7 formalin-fixed, paraffin-embedded and 
methacarn-fixed paraffin-embedded tissue sections) 
and immunoelectronmicroscopy.3 Cross-reactivity has 
been observed with human,1,3 bovine, sheep, goat, 
porcine, dog, cat,4,7 rabbit, hamster, guinea pig, rat,1,2,5,6

mouse,5 and chicken. Detection of slow myosin in 
formalin-fixed, paraffin-embedded tissues, is greatly 
enhanced by proteolytic digestion of the preparation.

Monoclonal Anti-Myosin (Skeletal, Slow) may be used 
for the localization of slow (Type I) myosin, using vari-
ous immunochemical assays such as ELISA, solid-
phase RIA, immunoblot, immunohistology and 
immunoelectronmicroscopy

Myosin is a 480 kDa protein known to interact with actin 
in muscle and in non-muscle cells. It contains two 
identical heavy chains (200 kDa each) and four light 
chains (15-26 kDa).  Myosin molecules consist of two 
major regions: tail (rod) and heads; they aggregate into 
filaments through the tail region and interact with actin 
and with ATP through the head region. Multiple forms of 
myosin heavy chains exist for each muscle type:  
skeletal, cardiac, smooth and in non-muscle.  Myosin 
isoforms exist in different types of skeletal muscle, 
depending on the physiological function of the muscle.8

Mammalian muscle fibers are classified primarily into 
slow (I), fast-red (IIa) and fast-white (IIb) major 
types.4,9,10 Changes in the speed of muscle contraction 
brought about by neural influences result from changes 
in the pattern of expression of myosin and other 
myofibrillar genes. Myosin heavy chains are encoded 
by a multigene family which is developmentally 
regulated.9-10 During differentiation of future muscles, 
fibers sequentially express heavy chain genes for 
embryonic, neonatal and adult myosin. Developing 
muscles express two isoforms of myosin, the embryonic 
and fetal (neonatal) forms, which are also encoded for 
by distinct heavy chain genes.4  The embryonic and 
fetal myosins have a high calcium-activated ATPase 
activity at alkaline pH; fibers that contain these myosins 
are therefore likely to appear similar, histochemically, to 
mature Type II fibers, even though the latter contain 
qualitatively distinct mature fast isomyosins. In the 
neonate, the principal myosin in developing fast and 
slow muscles is fetal myosin. During the first few weeks 
of life, fetal myosin is replaced by slow myosin in slow 
muscle and by fast myosins in fast muscle. There are 
three adult forms of skeletal myosin corresponding to 
the three types of muscle fibers. The heavy chains of 
these myosins are distinct, and are encoded by 
different heavy chain genes.  Muscle fiber type 
classification for type I and type II fibers has long been 
applied to the histological study of both normal and 
pathological human skeletal muscle. Studies of myosin 
isoforms expression in developing skeletal muscle also 
provide information about the control of gene 
expression in different muscle types by neural, 
hormonal and other factors.
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The advent of myosin immunocytochemistry, using 
antibodies to specific myosin heavy chains, has made it 
possible to trace the developmental history of the 
complex paths of myosin changes at the cellular level.  
Antibodies are also important because of the clues they 
may give concerning the pathogenesis of abnormalities 
in diseased muscle fibers.  Monoclonal antibodies that 
recognize epitopes peculiar to a particular 
developmental or mature isomyosin may be used to 
identify these isomyosins and thus to characterize the 
temporal pattern of their expression in different fibers 
during myogenesis.1

Reagent
Supplied as ascites fluid with 15 mM sodium azide as a 
preservative.

Precautions and Disclaimer
This product is for R&D use only, not for drug, 
household, or other uses. Please consult the Material 
Safety Data Sheet for information regarding hazards 
and safe handling practices.

Storage
For continuous use, store at 2-8 °C for up to one month. 
For extended storage freeze in working aliquots.  
Repeated freezing and thawing, or storage in "frost-
free" freezers, is not recommended. If slight turbidity 
occurs upon prolonged storage, clarify the solution by 
centrifugation before use.

Product Profile
Immunohistochemistry: a minimum working dilution of 
1:4,000 is determined by indirect immunoperoxidase 
labeling of protease-digested, formalin-fixed, paraffin-
embedded sections of rabbit tongue.

Immunoblotting: a minimum working dilution of 1:5,000 
is determined by using extract of rabbit or rat tongue.

Note: In order to obtain best results, it is recommended 
that each user determine the optimal working dilution 
for individual applications by titration assay.
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